
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 11-1016A

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler Loader

TIME & (Date of Award through July 31, 2012)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 27, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

  PRICE

  PER

 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 DAY 467.00 400.00 175.00 NO BID

  PRICE

  PER

 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 Week 927.00 1,200.00 450.00 NO BID

  PRICE

  PER

 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 MONTH 1,767.00 2,520.00 1,050.00 NO BID

 Crawler Loader 

Takeuchi TL130 Diesel, Volvo New Holland  

Manufacturer/Model Bobcat T190-G MCT135C C185  

  PRICE

PER

Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT DAY NO BID 300.00 175.00 225.00

PRICE

PER

Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT Week NO BID 900.00 450.00 550.00

PRICE

PER

Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT MONTH NO BID 1,750.00 1,050.00 1,600.00

Compact 

Rubber Track New Holland   

Manufacturer/Model Loader C185  

 

PRICE

  PER

 Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT DAY NO BID 300.00 200.00 225.00

PRICE

 PER

Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT Week NO BID 900.00 500.00 550.00

PRICE

 PER

Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT MONTH NO BID 1,750.00 1,100.00 1,600.00

Compact 

Rubber Track New Holland  

Manufacturer/Model Loader C190  
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Rental of Compact Excavators

FOR: and Crawler Loader

TIME & (Date of Award through July 31, 2012)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 27, 2011
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  PRICE

  PER

 D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB DAY 397.00 200.00 NO BID NO BID

 PRICE

 PER

 D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB Week 712.00 600.00 NO BID NO BID

 PRICE

PER

  D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB MONTH 1,322.00 1,600.00 NO BID NO BID

Deere 27D, Bobcat 325

Takeuchi TB125

Manufacturer/Model Bobcate 328

  PRICE

 PER

 D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model V-2203-EB DAY 407.00 200.00 NO BID NO BID

  PRICE

  PER

 D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model V-2203-EB Week 722.00 600.00 NO BID NO BID

  PRICE

   PER

 D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model V-2203-EB MONTH 1,347.00 1,600.00 NO BID NO BID

 

Bobcat 331 Compact

Manufacturer/Model Takeuchi TB135 Excavator

Compact Excavator CX17B, Mfg. Case, Model CX17B NO BID 175.00 150.00 195.00

Compact Excavator CX17B, Mfg. Case, Model CX17B NO BID 525.00 400.00 500.00

Compact Excavator CX17B, Mfg. Case, Model CX17B NO BID 1,575.00 850.00 1,500.00

Compact New Holland  

Manufacturer/Model  Excavator E15  
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Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B NO BID 180.00 165.00 205.00

Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B NO BID 540.00 420.00 550.00

Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B NO BID 1,620.00 925.00 1,600.00

Compact New Holland  

Manufacturer/Model  Excavator E27  

 

Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B NO BID 200.00 175.00 210.00

Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B NO BID 600.00 425.00 575.00

Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B NO BID 1,600.00 935.00 1,700.00

Compact New Holland  

Manufacturer/Model  Excavator E35  

Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B NO BID 200.00 NO BID 215.00

Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B NO BID 600.00 NO BID 615.00

Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B NO BID 1,600.00 NO BID 1,750.00

Compact

Manufacturer/Model  Excavator   
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Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B NO BID 250.00 NO BID 250.00

Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B NO BID 750.00 NO BID 700.00

Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B NO BID 2,250.00 NO BID 1,900.00

Compact

Manufacturer/Model  Excavator   

Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 NO BID 250.00 NO BID 270.00

Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 NO BID 750.00 NO BID 800.00

Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 NO BID 2,250.00 NO BID 2,300.00

Compact

Manufacturer/Model  Excavator   

Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment, Mfr. Case, Model 580 Super M Series NO BID 575.00 495.00 950.00

Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment, Mfr. Case, Model 580 Super M Series NO BID 1,650.00 1,050.00 1,300.00

Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment, Mfr. Case, Model 580 Super M Series NO BID 3,125.00 2,350.00 3,600.00

Load/Backhoe with   

Kent Hoe New Holland  

Manufacturer/Model  Ramp B95  
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Excavator Tracked, Mfr. Case, Model CX470B NO BID 1,333.00 NO BID NO BID

Excavator Tracked, Mfr. Case, Model CX470B NO BID 4,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Excavator Tracked, Mfr. Case, Model CX470B NO BID 12,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Excavator

Manufacturer/Model  Tracked   

Motor Grader, Mfr. Case, Model 865VHP Tier III NO BID 966.00 NO BID 600.00

Motor Grader, Mfr. Case, Model 865VHP Tier III NO BID 2,900.00 NO BID 1,800.00

Motor Grader, Mfr. Case, Model 865VHP Tier III NO BID 8,700.00 NO BID 5,400.00

Motor

Manufacturer/Model  Grader   

Rubber Tire Trencher, Mfr. ASTEC, Model RT960 NO BID 735.00 NO BID NO BID

Rubber Tire Trencher, Mfr. ASTEC, Model RT960 NO BID 2,200.00 NO BID NO BID

Rubber Tire Trencher, Mfr. ASTEC, Model RT960 NO BID 6,600.00 NO BID NO BID

Rubber Tire

Manufacturer/Model  Trencher   
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  0% Net Net Net

 Terms 0 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

 

Delivery Days 2-3 days 1-7 days 2 days 2 days

1

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Associated Supply Co., Inc. SAWS Website

 Aztec Rental

Equipment Depot

 Hertz Equipment Rental Corp.

Holt Cat

Volvo Rents Const. Equip.

6


